## **UNOFFICIAL COPY**



Doc# 2116122004 Fee \$88.00

RHSP FEE: \$9.00 RPRF FEE: \$1.00

KAREN A. YARBROUGH COOK COUNTY CLERK

DATE: 06/10/2021 09:16 AM PG: 1 OF 10

After Recording Return to:

DOOP THE GROUNDFLOOR REAL ESTATE 1, LLC 600 Peachtre: Street NE, Suite 810, Atlanta, GA 30308

#### UCC FINANCING STATEMENT COVER PAGE

GROUNDFLOOR REAL ESTATE 1, LLC to RLW PROPERTY PRESERVATION LLC Property commonly known as 2740 W War en Boulevard, Chicago, IL 60612 Loan in the amount of Three Hundred Eighteen Thousand Eight Hundred Forty and 00/100 dollars C/O/A/S O/F/CO (\$318,840.00)

Prepared by: LaRocca Hornik Rosen & Greenberg 40 Wall Street New York, NY 10005

FIRST AMERICAN TITLE FILE # AF1009252

2116122004 Page: 2 of 10

# UNOFFICIAL COPY

FIRST PERSONA  CITY  Chicago	modify, or abbreviate any or information in item 10 c	part of the Debtor of the Financing St	OR FILING OFFICE USE of some and some at a second of the International Addendum (Form UC)  NAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S)  POSTAL CODE	dividual Debtor CC1Ad)
full name; do not omit, vide the Individual Debt	modify, or abbreviate any or information in item 10 c	part of the Debtor of the Financing St  ADDITIO	r's name); if any part of the In atement Addendum (Form UC NAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S)	dividual Debtor CC1Ad)
full name; do not omit, vide the Individual Debt	modify, or abbreviate any or information in item 10 c	part of the Debtor of the Financing St  ADDITIO	r's name); if any part of the In atement Addendum (Form UC NAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S)	dividual Debtor CC1Ad)
full name; do not omit, vide the Individual Debt	modify, or abbreviate any or information in item 10 c	part of the Debtor of the Financing St  ADDITIO	r's name); if any part of the In atement Addendum (Form UC NAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S)	dividual Debtor CC1Ad)
FIRST PERSON/ CITY Chicago  ull nume; do not omit,	modify, or abbreviate any or information in item 10 c	part of the Debtor of the Financing St  ADDITIO	r's name); if any part of the In atement Addendum (Form UC NAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S)	dividual Debtor CC1Ad)
FIRST PERSON/ CITY Chicago  ull nume; do not omit,	modify, or abbreviate any or information in item 10 c	part of the Debtor of the Financing St  ADDITIO	r's name); if any part of the In atement Addendum (Form UC NAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S)	dividual Debtor CC1Ad)
CITY Chicago	AL NAME	STATE		
CITY Chicago	AL NAME	STATE		
Chicago		1	POSTAL CODE	
		I I	60624	COUNTRY
vida ir i malviduai Debi			's name); if any part of the In	
	or information in item to t	n ne chancing St	atement Addendum (Form Ot	JC (Ad)
<u>C</u>				
FIRST PEF SON	FIRST PEF SO! A! NAME		ADDITIONAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S) SI	
CITY	77/1	STATE	POSTAL CODE	COUNTRY
ECURED PARTY): Pro	ovide only one Se Jured 1'a	arty name (3a or 3t	) )	
FIRST PERSON	FIRST PERSONAL NAME		ADDITIONAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S)	
		Tá		<u> </u>
Atlanta			30308	USA
		. !	Vic.	
teral description	,		Co	
rust (see UCC1Ad, iten	17 and Instructions)	being administe	ered by a Decedent's Persona	el Representa
-1				
	CITY  ECURED PARTY): Pro  FIRST PERSONA  CITY Atlanta  teral description	CITY  FIRST PERSONAL NAME  CITY Atlanta  teral description.  rust (see UCC1Ad, item 17 and instructions)	CITY  FIRST PERSONAL NAME  CITY Atlanta  CIT	ECURED PARTY): Provide only one Setured Party name (3a or 3b)  FIRST PERSONAL NAME  ADDITIONAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S)  CITY Atlanta  STATE POSTAL CODE 3U:308  terral description.  Desire administered by a Decedent's Personal State of Check only if applicable and check only on the Agricultural Lien  A Debtor is a Transmitting Utility  Agricultural Lien  Non-UCC

2116122004 Page: 3 of 10

## **UNOFFICIAL COPY**

#### UCC FINANCING STATEMENT ADDENDUM **FOLLOW INSTRUCTIONS** 9. NAME OF FIRST DEBTOR: Same as line 1a or 1b on Financing Statement; if line 1b was left blank because Individual Debtor name did not fit, check here I 9a. ORGANIZATION'S NAME 9b. INDIVIDUAL'S SURNAME. FIRST PERSONAL '... ME ADDITIONAL NAME(\$)/INI (AL/3) THE ABOVE SPACE IS FOR FILING OFFICE USE ONLY 10. DEBTOR'S NAME: Provide (10a or 10b) or 10 gag additional Debtor name or Debtor name that did not fit in line 1b or 2b of the Financing Statement (Form UCC1) (use exact, full name; do not omit, modify, or abbreviate any part of the Sector's name) and enter the mailing address in line 10c 10a. ORGANIZATION'S NAME 10b, INDIVIDUAL'S SURNAME INDIVIDUAL'S FIRST PERSONAL NAME INDIVIDUAL'S ADDITIONAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S) SUFFIX 10c. MAILING ADDRESS POSTAL CODE COUNTRY STATE 11. ADDITIONAL SECURED PARTY'S NAME or ASSIGNOR SECURED PARTY'S NAME: Provide only one name (11a or 11b) 11a. ORGANIZATION'S NAME **GROUNDFLOOR REAL ESTATE 1, LLC** 11b. INDIVIDUAL'S SURNAME FIRST PERSONAL NAME ADDITIONAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S) SUFFIX 11c. MAILING ADDRESS POSTAL CODE COUNTRY STATE CITY 600 Peachtree Street NE, Suite 810 Atlanta GA 30308 USA 12. ADDITIONAL SPACE FOR ITEM 4 (Collateral): OFFICE This FINANCING STATEMENT is to be filed [for record] (or recorded) in the REAL ESTATE RECORDS (if applicable) 14. This FINANCING STATEMENT: covers timber to be cut covers as-extracted collateral is filed as a fixture filing 15, Name and address of a RECORD OWNER of real estate described in item 16 16. Description of real estate: (if Debtor does not have a record interest):

17. MISCELLANEOUS:

2116122004 Page: 4 of 10

## **UNOFFICIAL COPY**

#### **SCHEDULE A** PROPERTY DESCRIPTION

LOT 3 IN THE SUBDIVISION OF LOTS 23, 24, 25 AND 26 IN EDGAR LOOMIS SUBDIVISION OF LOTS 4, 5, 6, 7, 14, 16 AND 17 (EXCEPT THE WEST 33 FEET OF LOTS 5, 6 AND 16) IN TURNER'S SUBDIVISION OF LOT 4 IN THE PARTITION OF THE SOUTH 81.14 ACRES OF THE SOUTH HALF OF THE SOUTHEAST QUARTER OF SECTION 12, TOWNSHIP 39 NORTH, RANGE 13, EAST OF THE THIRD PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, IN COOK COUNTY, ILLINOIS.

Property commonly known as: 2740 W Warren Boulevard, Chicago, IL 60612.



2116122004 Page: 5 of 10

#### UNOFFICIAL COPY

#### **EXHIBIT A**

- A. All fixtures and systems and articles of personal property, of every kind and character, now owned or hereafter acquired by Mortgagor (Mortgagor's successors or assigns), which are now or hereafter attached to the Land, which is located in the County of Cook, State of Illinois and more particularly described in Schedule "A" attached hereto, or the Improvements, or used in or necessary to complete the proper planning, development, use, occupancy or operation thereof, or acquired (whether delivered to the Land or stored elsewhere) for use or installation in or on the Land or the Improvements, and all renewals and replacements of, substitutions for and additions to the foregoing, including, but without limiting the foregoing, all of the following items now owned or hereafter acquired by Mortgagor, any and all fixtures, systems, heating, ventilating, air conditioning, refrigerating, plumbing, water, sewer, lighting, generating, cleaning, storage, incinerating, waste disposal, sprinkler, fire extinguishing, communications, transportation (of people or things, including, but not limited to, stairways, elevators, escalator; and conveyors), data processing, security and alarm, laundry, food or drink preparation, storage of serving, gas, electrical and electronic, water, and recreational uses or purposes; all tanks, pipes, wiring, conduits, ducts, doors, partions, floor coverings, wall coverings, windows, window screens and shades, awnings, fans, motors, engines and boiles: motor vehicles; decorative items and art objects; and files, records and books of account (all of which are herein sometimes referred to together as "Accessories");
- B. All (a) plans and specifications for the Improvements; (b) approvals, entitlements and contracts relating to the Land or the Improvements or the Accessories or any part thereof; (c) deposits including, but not limited to, Mortgagor's rights in tenants' security deposits (if any), deposits with respect to utility services to the Land or the Improvements or the Accessories (rany part thereof, and any deposits or reserves hereunder or under any other Loan Document (as hereinafter defined) for taxes, insurance or otherwise, funds, accounts, contract rights, instruments, documents, commitments, general intaligibles, notes and chattel paper used in connection with or arising from or by virtue of any transactions related to the Land or the Improvements or the Accessories or any part thereof; (d) permits, licenses, franchises, bonds, cartificates and other rights and privileges obtained in connection with the Land or the Improvements or the Accessories or any part thereof; (e) leases, rents, royalties, bonuses, issues, profits, revenues and other benefits of the Land, the Improvements and the Accessories; and (f) other properties, rights, titles and interests, if any, specified in any Section or any Article of this Mortgage as being part of the Property;
- C. All proceeds, products, consideration, compensation and recoveries, direct or consequential, cash and noncash, of or arising from, as the case may be, (a) the properties, rights, titles and interests referred to above in paragraphs (A), (B), (C) and (D); (b) any sale, lease or other disposition thereof (c) each policy of insurance relating thereto (including premium refunds); (d) the taking thereof or of any rights apputent at thereto by eminent domain or sale in lieu thereof for public or quasi-public use under any law; and (e) any damage thereto whether caused by such a taking (including change of grade of streets, curb cuts or other rights of access) or otherwise caused; and
- D. All other interests of every kind and character, and proceeds thereof, which Mortgagor now has or hereafter acquires in, to or for the benefit of the properties, rights, titles and interests referred to above in paragraphs (A), (B), (C), (D) and all property used or useful in connection therewith, including, but not limited to, remainders, reversions and reversionary rights or interests.

## **UNOFFICIAL COPY**

B. E-MAIL CONTACT AT FILER (optional)						
C. SEND ACKNOWLEDGMENT TO: (Name and Address)	<del></del>	<u> </u>				
LAROCCA HORNIK ROSEN & GREENBE ATTN: JONATHAN L. HORNIK, ESQ. 83 SOUTH STRFET, SUITE 302 FREEHOLD, N. 07728	RG, LLP					
			E ABOVE SPACE IS	S FOI	R FILING OFFICE USE (	ONLY
1. DEBTOR'S NAME: Provide on', one Jehlor name (1a or 1b) name will not fit in line 1b, leave all of item 1 2 nk, check here			eviate any part of the D	ebtor's	s name); if any part of the In	dividual Debtor's
1a. ORGANIZATION'S NAME RLW PROPERTY PRESERVATION LLC					-	
OR 1b. INDIVIDUAL'S SURNAME	FIRS	T PERSONAL NAME	ADI	MOITIC	IAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S)	SUFFIX
1c. MAILING ADDRESS	CITY		STA		POSTAL CODE	COUNTRY
3438 W Polk Street	Chi	icago	IL.		60624	USA
2. DEBTOR'S NAME: Provide only one Debtor name (2a or 2b) oname will not fit in line 2b, leave all of item 2 blank, check here		do not omit, modify, or abbre lividual Debtor information in				
2a, ORGANIZATION'S NAME				<del></del>		
OR 2b. INDIVIDUAL'S SURNAME	FIRS	T PEF SON AL NAME	ADE	AOITIC	IAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S)	SUFFIX
2c. MAILING ADDRESS	CITY	77	STA	ATE	POSTAL CODE	COUNTRY
, <del></del>	SIGNOR SECURED F	ARTY): Provide only one So	ured Party name (3a	or 3b)		
3. SECURED PARTY'S NAME for NAME of ASSIGNEE of AS		, , , ,		···	· · · ·	••
3. SECURED PARTY'S NAME (or NAME of ASSIGNEE of AS  3a. ORGANIZATION'S NAME			10.	DITIO:	IAL BLASSECCENSHITSALICE	SUFFIX
3a. ORGANIZATION'S NAME GROUNDFLOOR REAL ESTATE 1, LLC	- Irion	T DEDOCULI MARE	Dr			
3a. ORGANIZATION'S NAME GROUNDFLOOR REAL ESTATE 1, LLC	FIRS	T PERSONAL NAME	ADO	DITION	IAL NAME(S)/INITIAL(S)	
3a. ORGANIZATION'S NAME GROUNDFLOOR REAL ESTATE 1, LLC	FIRS		STA G	4FE	POSTAL CODE	COUNTRY

5. Check only if applicable and check only one box: Collateral is held in a Trust (see UCC1Ad, item 17 and Instructions)	being administered by a Decedent's Personal Representative
6a. Check only if applicable and check only one box:	6b. Check only if applicable and check only one box:
Public-Finance Transaction Manufactured-Home Transaction A Debtor is a Transmitting Utility	Agricultural Lien Non-UCC Filing
7. ALTERNATIVE DESIGNATION (if applicable): Lessee/Lessor Consignee/Consignor Seller/Buy	er Bailee/Bailor Licensee/Licensor
8. OPTIONAL FILER REFERENCE DATA:	-

2116122004 Page: 7 of 10

## **UNOFFICIAL COPY**

#### UCC FINANCING STATEMENT ADDENDUM

FOLLOWINSTRUCTIONS					
NAME OF FIRST DEBTOR: Same as line 1a or 1b on Financing Statement; if because Individual Debtor name did not fit, check here.	line 1b was left biank				
9a. ORGANIZATION'S NAME		<del></del>			
9b. INDIVIDUAL'S SURNAME					
FIRST PERSONAL V. ME					
ADDITIONAL NAME(S)/INIT IAL( ))	İsuffi	x			
100		THE A	BOVE SPACE	S FOR FILING OFF	ICE USE ONLY
10. DEBTOR'S NAME: Provide (10a or 10h, or 2 one additional Debtor name or		not fit in line 1b or 2b			
do not omit, modify, or abbreviate any part of the Flottor's name) and enter the m  10a. ORGANIZATION'S NAME	nailing address in line	10c			
IDD. ORGANIZATIONS NAME					
OR 10b. INDIVIDUAL'S SURNAME					· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
INDIVIDUAL'S FIRST PERSONAL NAME					
INDIVIDUAL'S ADDITIONAL NAME(\$)(INITIAL(S)	4				SUFFIX
10c. MAILING ADDRESS	CITY		STATE	POSTAL CODE	COUNTRY
11. ADDITIONAL SECURED PARTY'S NAME or ASSIGN	OB SECURED 1	PRTY'S NAME: F	ļ	(44 445)	Į
11a. ORGANIZATION'S NAME GROUNDFLOOR REAL ESTATE 1, LLC	OK SCOOKES,	TT S INAIME. F	Tovide only <u>one</u> ha	ame (11a of 110)	
OR 11b. INDIVIDUAL'S SURNAME	FIRST PERSONAL	NAME	ADDITIO	NAL NAME(S)/INITIAL	(S) SUFFIX
11c. MAILING ADDRESS 600 Peachtree Street NE, Suite 810	CITY Atlanta		STATE	POSTAL CODE 30308	COUNTRY
12. ADDITIONAL SPACE FOR ITEM 4 (Collateral):	7 1001110				00.1
12. ADDITIONAL DI MOLT ON TILIN 4 (DUIMARILIA).			'5		
			,	Vic.	
				10	
				0	
13. This FINANCING STATEMENT is to be filed [for record] (or recorded) in the	14. This FINANCING	S STATEMENT:			
REAL ESTATE RECORDS (if applicable)			vers as-extracted	collateral is file	d as a fixture filing
15. Name and address of a RECORD OWNER of real estate described in item 16 (if Debtor does not have a record interest):	16. Description of n	eal estate:			
17. MISCELLANEOUS:					

2116122004 Page: 8 of 10

## **UNOFFICIAL COPY**

# EXHIBIT "A" DESCRIPTION OF PLEDGED COLLATERAL

- a. All Ownership Interests that the Debtor has in RLW PROPERTY PRESERVATION LLC, an Illinois limited liability company having its principal place of business at 3438 W Polk Street, Chicago, IL 60624 ("Borrower") now or hereafter acquired, and all certificates of ownership or other indicia of ownership representing any Ownership Interests, shares or otherwise referred to togeth r with all rights to the proceeds thereof as the "Units";
- b. All dividends and other distributions received by Pledgor from the Borrower ("Pledgor" means Reginald L. Wynne, Jr., Teo A. Adams, Jr. and Clifton K. Hooker and includes all co-signers, guarantors of the Note related Loan Documents; and
- c. All "Proceeds" and Assets come I by Borrower as such term is defined in the Uniform Commercial Code as the same may from time-to-time be in effect in the State of Illinois (the "Code").

2116122004 Page: 9 of 10

### **UNOFFICIAL COPY**

## EXHIBIT "B" LEASES & RENTS

All of Debtor's interest in any and all leases or leases, or subsequent leases, with amendments, if any, and all month-to-month tenancies with respect to portions or all of the real property located at 2740 W Warren Boulevard, Chicago, IL 60612 (the "Premises")(and more particularly described in Schedule "A" annexed hereto) and any modifications, supplements, extensions and renewals thereof and any guarantees of the lessee's obligations thereunder, and all rents, income, and profits arising from the leases and extensions and renewals thereof, if any, and together with all rents, income, and profits due or to become due from the Premises and from any and all of the leases or tenancies for the use and occupancy of the Premises or any part thereof which are now in existence or which may be created in the future during the term of this Assignment, whether or not recorded; together with and including, the Debtor's entire interest in any lease, tenancy, rental, or occupancy agreement now existing or which may be made hereafter affecting the Premises.

TOGETHER WITH all the right, power, and authority of the Debtor to alter, modify, or change or to terminate the term thereof or accept: surrender thereof or to cancel the same or to waive or release the lessee from the performance or observance by the lessee of any obligation or condition thereof or to accept rents or any other payments thereunder.

2116122004 Page: 10 of 10

#### **UNOFFICIAL COPY**

#### EXHIBIT "C'

#### CONTRACTS, PLANS, PERMITS, & APPROVALS

Debtor's interest in all agreements, contracts and contract rights between Debtor and any and all contractors, subcontractors and/or material suppliers, and all plans, permits, licenses and approvals in connection with the construction, renovation, development and improvement of the real property located at **2740 W Warren Boulevard, Chicago, IL 60612**, described in Schedule "A" attached hereto and made a part hereof, and any improvements thereon (the "Premises") and which agreements, contracts, contract rights, plans, permits, licenses and approvals are now in existence or which may be created, amended, supplemented or otherwise modified in the future, whether or not recorded, (and together with any other documents executed in connection therewith, including waivers and consents related thereto), including but not limited to the following:

- 1. All agreements with respect to architectural and engineering services for the improvements to the Premises;
- 2. All bonds securing payment and performance of Assignor's improvements to the Premises;
- 3. All of Assignor's contracts, now existing or hereafter entered into, for the furnishing of supplies, materials, labors, or services (increasing professional services) for the construction of the improvements to the Premises;
- 4. All Permits, licenses, and other certificates, now bold or hereafter acquired by Assignor, relating to the construction and operation of the improvements to the Premises; and
- 5. All plans and specifications (including site plans) relating to the construction and operating of the improvements to the Premises.

TOGETHER WITH all the right, power and authority of Debtor to alter, modify or change, or terminate any terms thereof or to release any party thereto from the obligation or condition thereof.